
 

Costumer´s card number. 
___________________________________________________ 
 
The insurance company demands that we register your name once. You 
receive a customer’s card that offers you advantages. 

The customer’s card costs € 2,00 only once 
 
• One ride free of charge on your birthday 

• Letter of confirmation of your achieved times 

• Invitation to events, special organizations for the fastest drivers 

First- and Surname: __________________________________________ 

Street & Number.:         __________________________________________ 

ZIP Code & City: __________________________________________ 

Telephon/Fax:  __________________________________________ 

Date of Birth :  __________________________________________ 

Weight:   __________________________________________ 

 

 
As a matter of principle a helmet must be worn. In case of a hired helmet a 
special hood is required for hygenic reasons. Attention: hot parts of the motor. 
Don’t lean on the motor when getting on or out. Clothing: tightfitting clothing is 
required. Scarves, ties and belts must be fastened. Please, wear long hair in 
your helmet or tie it together. The drive to the training run becomes invalid if you 
aren’t present for your assigned group.Those who act carelessly or 
inconsiderately are suspended from the run. In the whole driving area smoking 
is strictly forbidden. Attention: in case of violence no compensation! It is 
prohibited to drive with high heeled shoes! 
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Declaration of liability 
 
 
 
With this I declare and acknowledge by my signature that I enter the grounds of 
the RHR company exclusively and unlimited at my own risk, that I stay there 
and that I use their carts. The RHR company is not liable for damages resulting 
from the running of a rented cart and/or for those damages caused by the 
running of other vehicles, their drivers and/or my behaviour. Setting foot on and 
staying on the compound of RHR company, as well as participating in all 
activities occurs exclusively at my own risk. Liability for every possible damage 
is out of the question. Restricted liabilty is not applied if damages occur caused 
by the RHR company or by an employee because of carelessness or intention. 
  
 
I accept the resposibilty under civil and criminal law for the damages to persons, 
material or fortunes caused by myself or by the cart driven by myself. If the RHR 
company is made liable for compensation of damages that I caused, I grant the 
RHR company their first demand. 
 
 
I assure you that I don’t suffer from any physical disability or alcohol/drug 
addiction that influences my driving abilities. I will obey all the orders of the RHR 
company and /or their employees without exception. I accept unlimited liabilty 
for all the damaged that were caused on the cart that I hired because of 
improper treatment or because of my refusing to obey orders by the RHR 
company or their employees. Offences will be prosecuted if necessary. Legal 
domicile is Korneuburg. 
 
 
I agree that my dates mentioned above will be stored for data processing sake 
and will be used exclusively by RHR company. 
 
 
I have read, understood and accpeted the conditions explained above and 
acknowledge them unreserved by my signature. 
 
 
 
 
 
_______________________________________________________________ 
Date:    Signature 
                                   (for those under age the signature of  
                                   their legal guardian is required) 

 

 


